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1.0 INTRODUCTION 

1.1 On April 4, 2017 (the “Filing Date”), Payless Holdings LLC (“Payless Holdings”), 

Payless ShoeSource Canada Inc. (“Payless Canada”), Payless ShoeSource Canada GP 

Inc. (“PSS GP Inc.”) and Payless ShoeSource Canada LP (“Payless LP” and together 

with Payless Canada and PSS GP Inc., the “Payless Canada Group”) together with the 

other entities listed on Appendix “A” (collectively, “Payless”, or the “Chapter 11 

Debtors”) commenced voluntary reorganization proceedings (the “Chapter 11 

Proceedings”) in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Missouri 

(the “US Court”) by filing voluntary petitions for relief under Chapter 11 of Title 11 of 

the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. 101-1532 (the “US Code”). 

1.2 On the Filing Date, the Chapter 11 Debtors filed a number of motions for interim and 

final orders (the “First Day Motions”) in the Chapter 11 Proceedings to permit the 

Chapter 11 Debtors to continue to operate their business in the ordinary course and to 

advance their reorganization.  The First Day Motions, which were heard by the US Court 

on April 5, 2017, included a motion for entry of an order (the “Foreign Representative 

Order”) authorizing Payless Holdings to act as foreign representative on behalf of the 

Chapter 11 Debtors.   

1.3 On April 5, 2017, the US Court granted the Foreign Representative Order and a series of 

other orders in respect of the First Day Motions (the “First Day Orders”).  

1.4 On April 7, 2017, Payless Holdings commenced proceedings (the “CCAA Recognition 

Proceedings”, together with the Chapter 11 Proceedings, the “Restructuring 

Proceedings”) before this Court (the “Court”) pursuant to Part IV of the Companies’ 
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Creditors Arrangement Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, as amended (the “CCAA”). On the 

same date, the Court granted an initial recognition order (the “Initial Recognition 

Order”) pursuant to sections 46, 47 and 48 of the CCAA, among other things: (i) 

declaring that Payless Holdings is a “foreign representative” (the “Foreign 

Representative”); (ii) declaring that the Chapter 11 Proceedings are recognized as a 

“foreign main proceeding” under the CCAA; and (iii) granting a stay of proceedings in 

respect of the Chapter 11 Debtors. 

1.5 On April 12, 2017, the Court issued an endorsement granting a supplemental order (the 

“Supplemental Order”) pursuant to section 49 of the CCAA, among other things: 

(i) recognizing in Canada and enforcing certain First Day Orders, except for the interim 

DIP order; (ii) appointing Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. (“A&M Canada”) as the 

information officer in respect of the CCAA Recognition Proceedings (in such capacity, 

the “Information Officer”); (iii) staying any claims, rights, remedies, liens or 

proceedings against or in respect of the Chapter 11 Debtors; and (iv) restraining the right 

of any person or entity to, among other things, discontinue or terminate any supply of 

products or services to the Chapter 11 Debtors. 

1.6 On June 21, 2017, the Court issued an order that recognized certain final orders of the US 

Court which granted the relief in the First Day Orders on a final basis. 

1.7 On July 26, 2017, the US Court confirmed Payless’ Fifth Amended Joint Plan of 

Reorganization dated July 21, 2017 (the “Plan”) and the Plan Supplement dated July 10, 

2017 (as amended, supplemented and otherwise modified, the “Plan Supplement”, and 
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together with the Plan, the “Confirmed Plan”) by entering the confirmation order 

requested by the Chapter 11 Debtors (the “Confirmation Order”). 

1.8 On July 28, 2017, the Court issued an order (the “Plan Recognition Order”), among 

other things: (i) recognizing the Confirmation Order; (ii) authorizing and directing the 

Foreign Representative and the other Chapter 11 Debtors to take all steps and actions, 

and to do all things, necessary or appropriate to implement the Confirmed Plan in 

accordance with its terms; and (iii) terminating the Stay Period (as defined in the 

Supplemental Order) and the stay of proceedings contained in the Initial Recognition 

Order in respect of the Chapter 11 Debtors (collectively with the Stay Period, the “Stay”) 

upon the Information Officer filing a certificate (the “Information Officer’s 

Certificate”) with the Court confirming that the effective date of the Confirmed Plan (the 

“Effective Date”) had occurred. 

1.9 The Effective Date occurred on August 10, 2017 and on August 11, 2017, in accordance 

with the provisions of the Plan Recognition Order, the Information Officer filed the 

Information Officer’s Certificate resulting in a termination of the Stay in the CCAA 

Recognition Proceedings. 

1.10 The Information Officer filed a Pre-Filing Report dated April 7, 2017, a First Report 

dated June 7, 2017, a Second Report dated June 19, 2017, and a Third Report dated July 

26, 2017 which collectively provide further background in respect of the Restructuring 

Proceedings. The Information Officer’s reports can be found on the Information Officer’s 

website at https://www.alvarezandmarsal.com/paylesscanada.  
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2.0 TERMS OF REFERENCE 

2.1 In preparing this report (the “Fourth Report”), A&M Canada has relied solely on 

information and documents provided by the Foreign Representative, the other Chapter 11 

Debtors and their Canadian legal counsel (collectively the “Information”). Except as 

otherwise described in this Fourth Report in respect of the Payless cash flow forecast:  

(a) the Information Officer has reviewed the Information for reasonableness, internal 

consistency and use in the context in which it was provided.  However, the 

Information Officer has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy 

or completeness of the Information in a manner that would wholly or partially 

comply with Canadian Auditing Standards (“CAS”) pursuant to the Chartered 

Professional Accountants of Canada Handbook (the “Handbook”), and 

accordingly, the Information Officer expresses no opinion or other form of 

assurance contemplated under CAS in respect of the Information; and  

(b) some of the information referred to in this Fourth Report consists of forecasts and 

projections.  An examination or review of the financial forecasts and projections, 

as outlined in the Handbook, has not been performed.  

2.2 Future-oriented financial information referred to in this Fourth Report was prepared 

based on estimates and assumptions made by Payless’s management.  Readers are 

cautioned that, since projections are based upon assumptions about future events and 

conditions that are not ascertainable, the actual results will vary from the projections, and 

the variations could be significant.  
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2.3 This Fourth Report should be read in conjunction with the Affidavit of Neil Hansen, 

Senior Vice President and Chief Financial Officer of Payless Holdings LLC, sworn on 

September 27, 2017 (the “Hansen Affidavit”).  

2.4 Unless otherwise stated, all monetary amounts contained in this Fourth Report are 

expressed in United States dollars, which is the Chapter 11 Debtors’ common reporting 

currency. 

3.0 PURPOSE OF THIS REPORT 

3.1 The purpose of this Fourth Report is to provide the Court with information in respect of 

the motion brought by the Foreign Representative for an Order (the “Escrow Funds and 

Discharge Order”):  

(a) authorizing and directing the Information Officer to return the Escrow Funds 

(defined below) to the Payless Canada Group (or as the Payless Canada Group 

may direct);  

(b) authorizing and approving the fees and disbursements of the Information Officer 

and its legal counsel incurred in connection with the Restructuring Proceedings as 

described in the Fee Affidavits (defined below); 

(c) authorizing and approving the fees and disbursements of the Information Officer 

and its legal counsel that are not set out in the Fee Affidavits but incurred 

following September 9, 2017 in respect of the Information Officer and August 31, 

2017 in respect of its legal counsel for the performance of the duties of the 

Information Officer up to a maximum of C$25,000 of aggregate fees plus any 
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reasonable disbursements incurred in respect thereof and any applicable taxes on 

such fees and disbursements; 

(d) ordering that A&M Canada be discharged as Information Officer upon filing a 

certificate of discharge (the “Discharge Certificate”) evidencing the completion 

of its duties as Information Officer;  

(e) declaring that the Administration Charge shall be deemed to be discharged upon 

the filing of the Discharge Certificate; and  

(f) approving this Fourth Report of the Information Officer and the activities of the 

Information Officer described herein.  

4.0 THE ESCROW FUNDS  

4.1 Pursuant to an endorsement of the Court dated April 27, 2017, a copy of which is 

appended to the Hansen Affidavit, the Payless Canada Group paid the Information 

Officer funds to hold in escrow (the “Escrow Funds”) on account of April pre-filing rent 

(the “Unpaid April Rent”) owing to landlords of the Payless Canada Group (the 

“Landlords”). As of September 30, 2017, the Escrow Funds totaled C$465,779.55, 

including interest. The Information Officer continues to hold the Escrow Funds pending 

further order of this Court. 

4.2 The Information Officer understands that on or about September 6, 2017, the Payless 

Canada Group paid the amounts owing in respect of the Unpaid April Rent to the 

respective Landlords. Accordingly, it is the Information Officer’s view that it is 
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appropriate for the Information Officer to remit the Escrow Funds to the Payless Canada 

Group. 

5.0 APPROVAL OF FEES 

5.1 The Supplemental Order requires that the Information Officer and its legal counsel pass 

their accounts from time to time before a judge of this Court.  The Information Officer 

and its legal counsel have maintained detailed records of their professional costs and time 

during the course of the Restructuring Proceedings. 

5.2 The Affidavit of Alan J. Hutchens, a Senior Vice-President of A&M Canada, sworn 

September 26, 2017 (the “Hutchens Affidavit”) attests to the fees and disbursements of 

the Information Officer for the period March 30, 2017 to September 9, 2017 in the 

amount of C$338,216.11, comprised of fees of C$261,570.00, disbursements (primarily 

for publication of notices of the proceedings in The Globe and Mail and La Presse 

newspapers) of C$37,736.28 and HST of $38,909.83. 

5.3 The Affidavit of Ashley Taylor, a partner with the law firm Stikeman Elliott LLP 

(“Stikeman”), sworn September 26, 2017 (the “Taylor Affidavit” and, together with the 

Hutchens Affidavit, the “Fee Affidavits”) attests to the fees and disbursements of 

Stikeman, acting as legal counsel to the Information Officer, for the period from March 

31, 2017 to August 31, 2017 in the amount of C$187,167.51, including disbursements 

and HST.  The Information Officer confirms that the fees and disbursements set out in the 

invoices of Stikeman relate to advice sought by the Information Officer and that, in the 

Information Officer’s view, the fees and disbursements of Stikeman are reasonable.  
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5.4 Copies of the Hutchens Affidavit and the Taylor Affidavit are attached as Appendix “B” 

and Appendix “C”, respectively. 

5.5 In addition to approving the amounts set forth in the Fee Affidavits, the Escrow Funds 

and Discharge Order also seeks authorization and approval of the fees and disbursements 

of the Information Officer and its legal counsel that are not set out in the Fee Affidavits 

but have been incurred since their last invoices were rendered or will be incurred in the 

performance of their duties as Information Officer, up to a maximum of C$25,000 of 

aggregate fees plus any reasonable disbursements and any applicable taxes on such fees 

and disbursements (the “Maximum Remaining Amount”). The Maximum Remaining 

Amount was determined on the assumption that the motion for the Escrow Funds and 

Discharge Order proceeds on an uncontested basis.  The Information Officer will submit 

further accounts to legal counsel of the Foreign Representative for fees and 

disbursements actually incurred by it and Stikeman.  In the event that the Maximum 

Remaining Amount is exceeded, the Information Officer will submit the additional 

accounts to the Court for approval. 

5.6 To the extent that approved fees and disbursements have not been paid, the Information 

Officer and Stikeman intend to apply their respective retainers to such amounts.  The 

remainder of the retainers, if any, will be returned to the Payless Canada Group following 

the discharge of the Information Officer.  

5.7 The Foreign Representative has reviewed the Fee Affidavits and believes the fees and 

disbursements described therein and the Maximum Remaining Amount are reasonable in 

the circumstances.  Accordingly, the Information Officer believes that it is appropriate for 
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the Court to authorize and approve the fees and disbursements described in the Fee 

Affidavits and the Maximum Remaining Amount.  

6.0 ACTIVITIES OF THE INFORMATION OFFICER  

6.1 The activities of the  Information Officer since the date of its Third Report, being July 26, 

2017, have included: 

(a) continuing to make non-confidential materials filed with the Court publicly 

available on the website maintained by the Information Officer in respect of these 

CCAA Recognition Proceedings at www.alvarezandmarsal.com/paylesscanada; 

(b) responding to inquiries from stakeholders regarding the Restructuring 

Proceedings; 

(c) monitoring the Chapter 11 Debtors’ restructuring website maintained by Prime 

Clerk LLC for activity and developments in the Chapter 11 Proceedings;  

(d) discussions with legal counsel, the Chapter 11 Debtors’ Canadian and U.S. legal 

counsel, the financial advisor to the Chapter 11 Debtors and certain management 

of the Chapter 11 Debtors regarding matters relevant to the Restructuring 

Proceedings;  

(e) communicating with legal counsel, the Chapter 11 Debtors’ Canadian and U.S. 

legal counsel, the U.S. financial advisor to the Chapter 11 Debtors, certain 

management of the Chapter 11 Debtors and legal counsel to certain Landlords to 

discuss and resolve certain matters of concern to the Landlords;  
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(f) attending the hearing held in respect of the Foreign Representative’s motion 

seeking the Plan Recognition Order via video conference on July 28, 2017; and 

(g) preparing this Fourth Report and reviewing draft materials of the Foreign 

Representative in connection with this motion for the Escrow Funds and 

Discharge Order.  

6.2 The Foreign Representative is seeking approval of this Fourth Report and the activities of 

the Information Officer set out herein. 

7.0 DISCHARGE OF THE INFORMATION OFFICER AND TERMINATION OF THE 

RESTRUCTURING PROCEEDINGS 

7.1 The Effective Date of the Confirmed Plan occurred on August 10, 2017 and the Chapter 

11 Debtors have now successfully emerged from the Chapter 11 Proceedings as 

reorganized entities.  The Chapter 11 Proceedings are substantially complete and there 

will be no need for the Court to recognize any further orders of the US Court.  In 

addition, other than the activities described in this Fourth Report, the Information Officer 

does not anticipate any further steps being required in these Restructuring Proceedings.  

Accordingly, the Information Officer believes that it is appropriate that an order be issued 

discharging A&M Canada as Information Officer and relieving it from any further duties 

in respect of these Restructuring Proceedings upon the filing of the Discharge Certificate. 

The Discharge Certificate is expected to be filed following the return of the Escrow 

Funds. 
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ADDITIONAL CHAPTER 11 DEBTORS 

 

Payless Intermediate Holdings LLC  
WBG PSS Holdings LLC  
Payless Inc. 
Payless Finance, Inc.  
Collective Brands Services, Inc.  
PSS Delaware Company 4, Inc. 
Shoe Sourcing, Inc  
Payless ShoeSource, Inc 
Eastborough, Inc. 
Payless Purchasing Services, Inc. 
Payless ShoeSource Merchandising, Inc. 
Payless Gold Value CO, Inc. 
Payless ShoeSource Distribution, Inc. 
Payless ShoeSource Worldwide, Inc.  
Payless NYC, Inc. 
Payless ShoeSource of Puerto Rico, Inc.  
Payless Collective GP, LLC 
Collective Licensing, LP 
Collective Licensing International LLC  
Clinch, LLC 
Collective Brands Franchising Services, LLC  
Payless International Franchising, LLC 
Collective Brands Logistics, Limited 
Dynamic Assets Limited 
PSS Canada, Inc.  

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

APPENDIX “B” 





















































































 

 

 

 

 

 

APPENDIX “C” 

 



Court File No. CV-17-011758-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES' CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT, 
R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED 

AND IN THE MATTER OF PAYLESS HOLDINGS LLC, PAYLESS SHOESOURCE 
CANADA INC., PAYLESS SHOESOURCE CANADA GP INC. AND THOSE OTHER 

ENTITIES LISTED ON SCHEDULE "A" HERETO 

APPLICATION OF PAYLESS HOLDINGS LLC UNDER SECTION 46 OF THE 
COMPANIES' CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED 

(Applicants) 

AFFIDAVIT OF ASHLEY TAYLOR 
(SWORN SEPTEMBER 26, 2017) 

I, Ashley Taylor, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH 

AND SAY: 

1. I am a partner with the law firm of Stikeman Elliott LLP ("Stikeman Elliott"), 

lawyers of Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. ("A&M Canada") in its capacity as the Information 

Officer in the above-noted proceedings and, as such, I have knowledge of the matters to 

which I hereinafter depose. 

2. This affidavit is sworn in support of a motion for, inter alia, the approval of the fees 

and disbursements of Stikeman Elliott for the period from March 31, 2017 to August 31, 2017, 

inclusive. 

3. During the period from March 31, 2017 to August 31, 2017, Stikeman Elliott docketed 

259.63 hours, amounting to legal fees invoiced in the amount of $163,650.35 and 

disbursements and other charges in the amount of $1,984.61 plus Harmonized Sales Tax 

("HST") of $21,532.55. 

4. Attached hereto and marked collectively as Exhibit "A" are copies of the accounts 

rendered by Stikeman Elliott to A&M Canada, in its capacity as Information Officer, from 
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5. This affidavit is sworn in support of a motion for, inter alia, the approval of the fees 

and disbursements of Stikeman Elliott and for no improper purp 

SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of 
Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, on 
September 26, 2017. 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 

N 	t<  

-2 

March 31, 2017 to August 31, 2017. Certain confidential and/or privileged information have 

been redacted from the invoices. 

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit "B" is a schedule summarizing each invoice included in 

Exhibit "A", including the fees, expenses, HST and total fees charged in each invoice. 

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit "C" is a schedule summarizing the billing rates and total 

amounts billed with respect to each member of Stikeman Elliott who rendered services to 

A&M Canada, in its capacity as Information Officer. 

7. Additional professional time has been required following August 31, 2017 as part of 

winding up these proceedings and further time is expected to be required. Stikeman Elliott 

estimates the fees for this additional professional time will be no more than $12,500, 

exclusive of HST and disbursements. 

8. The hourly billing rate applied in the invoices of Stikeman Elliott were no more than 

Stikeman Elliott's normal hourly rates which were in effect from March 31, 2017 to August 

31, 2017, and are comparable to the hourly rates charged by Stikeman Elliott for services 

rendered in relation to similar proceedings. 

9. To the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by Stikeman Elliott are comparable to 

the rates charged by other firms in the Toronto market for the provision of similar 

restructuring services. 
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SCHEDULE "A" 

ADDITIONAL CHAPTER 11 DEBTORS 

Payless Intermediate Holdings LLC 
WBG PSS Holdings LLC 
Payless Inc. 
Payless Finance, Inc. 
Collective Brands Services, Inc. 
PSS Delaware Company 4, Inc. 
Shoe Sourcing, Inc 
Payless ShoeSource, Inc 
Eastborough, Inc. 
Payless Purchasing Services, Inc. 
Payless ShoeSource Merchandising, Inc. 
Payless Gold Value CO, Inc. 
Payless ShoeSource Distribution, Inc. 
Payless ShoeSource Worldwide, Inc. 
Payless NYC, Inc. 
Payless ShoeSource of Puerto Rico, Inc. 
Payless Collective GP, LLC 
Collective Licensing, LP 
Collective Licensing International LLC 
Clinch, LLC 
Collective Brands Franchising Services, LLC 
Payless International Franchising, LLC 
Collective Brands Logistics, Limited 
Dynamic Assets Limited 
PSS Canada, Inc. 



EXHIBIT "A" 



THIS IS EXHIBIT "A", referred to in the 
Affidavit of Ashley Taylor, sworn on 
September 26, 2017. 

	.., 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 



EXHIBIT "A" 
Copies of Stikeman Elliott LLP's Invoices 

Services Rendered from March 31, 2017 to August 31, 2017 
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STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

Stikeman Elliott LLP, Barristers & Solicitors 

5300 Commerce Court West, 199 Bay Street, Toronto, Canada M5L 189 

Tel: (416) 869-5500 Fax: (416) 947-0866 www.stikeman.com  
G.S.T.11-1.S.T. NO. 1214111360001 

Q.S.T. No. 1018978624 

Invoice 

Alvarez & Marsal 
220 Bay Street, Suite 2900 
Royal Bank Plaza, South Tower 
Toronto, ON M5J 2J1 

Attention: Alan Hutchens 

May 12, 2017 
File No. 1194991005 

Clients Reference No. 119499 

Invoice No. 5537222 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with Payless ShoeSource for the 
period up to May 12, 2017. 

Date 	Timekeeper 	Hours Description 	 Amount 

Mar 31, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	6.08 	Research regarding guarantees of US 	3,222.40 
obligations; review various Payless 
documents; draft email to A. Taylor 
regarding research on DIP issues; 

Mar 31, 2017 	M. Obee Tower 1.00 	Discuss role of information officer 	725.00 
and review draft DIP documentation. 

Mar 31, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	3.75 	Telephone conversation with M. 	3,375.00 
Wasserman and A. Hutchens; 
telephone conversation with A. 
Hutchens; conversation with L. 
Nicholson; telephone conversation 
with M. Obee-Tower; telephone 
conversation with A. Hutchens; 
telephone conversation with M. 
MacKenzie; 

Apr 1, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	5.58 	Review case law on information 	2,957.40 
officers acting as financial advisors; 
email to A. Taylor on research; review 
various emails; research regarding 
recent roll up in Canadian 
proceedings; email to A. Taylor on 
roll ups; review Osler materials for 
Part N recognition application; 
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STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

Date 
	

Timekeeper 	Hours Description 	 Amount 

Apr 1, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	4.50 	Review research memos; telephone 	4,050.00 
conversation with M. Wasserman; 
Review Initial Application draft 
materials; 

Apr 2, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	8.50 	Call with A&M; incorporate various 	4,505.00 
comments into Osier application 
materials; review DIP agreement; 
commence drafting DIP section of 
pre-filing report; call and email with 
M. Brouwer regarding employee 
claims; email to M. Brouwer 
regarding DIP agreement; review US 
motions; 

Apr 2, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	2.33 	Conference call re Initial Application 	2,097.00 
materials; emails re DIP application; 

Apr 3, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	7.17 	Draft DIP section of pre-filing report; 	3,800.10 
review US DIP motion; email to M. 
Obee Tower; 

Apr 3, 2017 	M. Obee Tower 3.17 	Review draft motion materials and 	2,298.25 
draft DIP credit agreement. 

Apr 3, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	1.25 	Telephone conversation with M. 	1,125.00 
MacKenzie; telephone conversation 
with A. Hutchens; conflicts check; 
retainer letter; all emails re retainer; 

Apr 4, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	4.33 	Email to P. Riesterer; edit DIP section 	2,294.90 
of the pre-filing report; review DIP 
Term Loan Agreement; email draft 
DIP section to A&M; review DIP 
Order; 

Apr 4, 2017 	M. Obee Tower 3.57 	Review and revise portion of report 	2,588.25 
related to DIP credit agreement and 
corresponding review of DIP credit 
agreement. 

Apr 4, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.75 	Telephone conversation with M. 	675.00 
MacKenzie; all emails re filing; all 
emails re DIP; 

Apr 5, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	10.17 	Review and comment on pre-filing 	5,390.10 
report; input various comments into 
the report; review latest Part IV 
application materials; incorporate 
various comments into the pre-filing 
report; 

Apr 5, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	4.50 	Review revised application materials; 	4,050.00 
telephone conversation with M. 

Page 2 of 10 
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STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

Date 
	

Timekeeper 	Hours Description 	 Amount 

Wasserman re Filing Time; 
conversation with L Nicholson; 
telephone conversation with M. 
Wasserman; review and revise draft 
report; telephone conversation with 
A. Hutchens; 

Apr 6, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	11.75 	Continue editing pre-filing report; 	6,227.50 
review liquidation analysis section; 
call with M. Mackenzie; review 
restructuring support agreement; 
draft language regarding 
supplemental order charge; draft 
language regarding A&M's role; 
various call with P. Riesterer 
regarding pre-filing report; email 
report to NRF, G. Morawetz and 
Osier; review Payless factum; 

Apr 6, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	8.08 	Revise 1st report; emails re Rents; 	7,272.00 
conversation with L. Nicholson; 
telephone conversations with A. 
Hutchens; telephone conversation 
with M. MacKenzie; 

Apr 7, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	6.00 	Edit pre-filing report; review 	3,180.00 
application materials; prepare pre-
filing report and serve; draft 
information officer consent; prepare 
for and attend court for recognition 
proceeding; 

Apr 7, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	8.17 	Telephone conversation with M. 	7,353.00 
Wasserman; telephone conversation 
with A. Hutchens; conversation with 
L Hutchison; telephone conversation 
with V. Gauthier; review the report; 
attendance at Court; conversation 
with A. Hutchens; telephone 
conversation with M. Wasserman; 

Apr 8, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	1.75 	Telephone conversations with A. 	1,575.00 
Hutchens; conference call re Part TV 
Application; telephone conversation 
with J. MacDonald; 

Apr 9, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	3.67 	Prepare for and attend hearing on 	1,945.10 
supplementary order and ABL 
Lenders' charge; email to P. Riesterer 
regarding supplementary order; 

Page 3 of 10 
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STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount 

email pre-filing report to D. Ullmann; 
review emails regarding consent 
endorsement; 

Apr 9, 2017 A.J. Taylor 1.50 Conference 	call 	re 	Part 	IV 1,350.00 
Application; all entails; 

Apr 10, 2017 A.J. Taylor 4.58 Telephone 	conversation 	with 	M. 4,122.00 
Wasserman; telephone conversation 
with 	J. 	MacDonald; 	telephone 
conversation 	with 	A. 	Hutchens; 
conversation with L. Nicholson; 

Apr 11, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.42 Email 	website 	materials 	to 	M. 222.60 
Brouwer; review emails regarding 
information requests from landlords. 

Apr 11, 2017 A.J. Taylor 1.75 8:30 	Attendance 	telephone 
conversation 	with 	T. 	Reyes; 
conversation 	with 	J. 	MacDonald; 
telephone 	conversation 	with 	A. 

1,575.00 

Hutchens; 	telephone 	call 	with 	J. 
MacDonald; 

Apr 12, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.67 Review 	endorsement 	of 	RSJ 355.10 
Morawetz; 	call 	with 	P. 	Riesterer; 
email 	to 	endorsement 	of 	RSJ 
Morawetz to the service list. 

Apr 12, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.75 Telephone 	conversation 	with 	J. 675.00 
Macdonald; telephone conversation 
with A. Hutchens re Info Request; 
telephone 	conversation 	with 	A. 
Hutchens; 	Telephone 	conversation 
with M. Wasserman; 

Apr 13, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.17 Emails 	with 	A&M 	regarding 
supplemental order. 

90.10 

Apr 13, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.42 All emails re Supplemental Order; 378.00 
Apr 14, 2017 L Nicholson 0.17 Email to M. Brouwer regarding stay. 90.10 
Apr 16, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.25 All emails re Landlords 225.00 
Apr 17, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.33 Edit newspaper notice; call with Osler 

regarding newspaper notice; email to 
174.90 

M. MacKenzie regarding newspaper 
notice; 

Apr 17, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.83 Telephone 	conversation 	with 	A. 747.00 
Hutchens; 	telephone 	conversation 
with M. MacKenzie; telephone 
conversation with M. Wasserman; 
review Notice; 

Apr 18, 2017 D.A. Arseneau 0.33 Revision Press Notice of Filings. 174.90 
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Apr 21, 2017 

Apr 22, 2017 
Apr 23, 2017 
Apr 24, 2017 

Apr 24, 2017 

Apr 25, 2017 

A.J. Taylor 

A.J. Taylor 
A.J. Taylor 
L. Nicholson 

A.J. Taylor 

L. Nicholson 

STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

Apr 19, 2017 	L. Nicholson 

Hours Description 	 Amount 

1.83 	Translation - Press Notice of Filings - 	704.55 
Payless ShoeSource. 

1.08 	Emails re Notice; Emails re 
	

972.00 
Landlords; telephone conversation 
with M. MacKenzie; 

2.75 	Call with M. Brouwer; email French 	1,457.50 
translation of newspaper notice to 
A&M; review draft supplemental 
order; email to A&M regarding 
changes to supplemental order; call 
with Osler regarding appointment 
with Justice Newbould; call with 
A&M regarding seeking appointment 
with Justice Newbould; 

1.75 	Conversation with L. Nicholson; 	1,575.00 
telephone conversation with A. 
Hutchens; telephone conversation 
with D. Bish; telephone conversation 
with Osiers; 

0.58 	Email to P. Riesterer; discussion with 	307.40 
A. Taylor regarding obtaining court 
time; reviewing Payless endorsement 
on recognition of the DIP; 

2.33 	Emails re Order; conversation with L. 	2,097.00 
Nicholson; telephone conversation 
with D. Bish; telephone conversation 
with A. Hutchens; review reasons; 
telephone conversation with A. 
Hutchens and L. Nicholson; 
telephone conversation with M. 
Wasserman; 

0.25 	Call with P. Riesterer; call with A&M 	132.50 
regarding court time; canvassing 
available court time; 

0.25 	All emails re Landlords and the 	225.00 
Order; 

0.25 	Emails re Landlord 	 225.00 
0.25 	Emails re Landlords; 	 225.00 
0.10 	Discussion with A. Taylor; email to P. 	53.00 

Riesterer regarding 8:30 appointment; 
0.25 	Telephone conversation with M. 	225.00 

Wasserman; 
1.25 	Call with Osier and A&M; call with 	662.50 

company and Osler regarding cash 

Date 
	

Timekeeper 

Apr 18, 2017 
	

T.-.M. Gravel 

Apr 18, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

Apr 19, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

Apr 20, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Apr 20, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

Apr 21, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 
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STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

Date Timekeeper 	Hours Description Amount 

  

	

Apr 27, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 

	

Apr 28, 2017 	L. Nicholson 

flow; review cash flow statement; call 
with A&M; 

	

2.17 	All emails re 9:30 appointment; 	1,953.00 
telephone conversation with A. 
Hutchens; telephone conversation 
with M. Wasserman and A. Hutchens; 
conference call re cashflow; telephone 
conversation with A. Hutchens and L. 
Nicholson; 

	

2.17 	Prepare for and attend 9:30 	1,150.10 
appointment; preparing for meeting 
at Osier regarding DIP and 
supplemental order; call with A. 
Hutchens; 

	

6.42 	9:30 Appointment; conversation with 	5,778.00 
A. Hutchens; conversation with D. 
Bish; telephone conversation with A. 
Hutchens; telephone conversation 
with M. Wasserman; conference call 
re Rent; conversation with L. 
Nicholson; telephone conversation 
with A. Hutchens; 

	

2.67 	Attend 9:30 appointment; distribute 	1,415.10 
endorsement to service list; arrange 
for transcription of endorsement; 
review DIP agreement for borrowing 
base calculation; en-tail to A&M 
regarding reserve for admin charge 
under the DIP; 

	

1.33 	9:30 Appointment re Rent Payments; 	1,197.00 

	

3.33 	Research regarding whether Part IV 	1,764.90 
proceeding grinds down a landlords' 
preferred claim; 

	

1.20 	Telephone conversation with A. 	1,080.00 
Hutchens; review all emails re 
Landlords; 

	

0.42 	Email 	re 	Order; 	telephone 	378.00 
conversation with D. Ullmann; 

	

0.75 	Emails 	re 	Order; 	telephone 	675.00 
conversation with P. Riesterer; 
telephone conversation with A. 
Hutchens; entails re form of order; 
telephone conversation with C. 
Prophet; telephone conversation with 

Apr 25, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

Apr 26, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Apr 26, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

Apr 27, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Apr 28, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

Apr 30, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

May 1, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 
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STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount  

P. 	Riesterer; 	emails 	re 	landlord 
information; 

May 2, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.75 Call with M. MacKenzie regarding 
reduction of landlord claims 
following commencement of Part 1V 
proceeding; call with A&M; 

397.50 

May 2, 2017 A.J. Taylor 1.58 Emails re NDAs; call with A&M; call 
with Osier; 

1,422.00 

May 3, 2017 L. Nicholson 3.17 Review 	Plan 	and 	disclosure 
statement; email to A&M regarding 

1,680.10 

Plan 	amendment 	details; 	review 
objections to Plan filed in US; email to 
A&M regarding objections that have 
been filed and status of US hearing; 

May 3, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.50 Emails 	re 	disclosure 	plan; 
conversation with L. Nicholson; 

450.00 

May 4, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.20 Email proof of claim to L. Galessiere; 
email to M. Shakra; 

106.00 

May 4, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.50 Telephone 	conversation 	with 	A. 450.00 
Hutchens re Inventory and Landlord 
report; telephone conversation with 
M. 	Wasserman; 	telephone 
conversation with P. Riesterer; 

May 5, 2017 L. Nicholson 1.42 Review letters from Makes regarding 
stay; email letters to A&M; draft 
email update to RSJ Morawetz; 

752.60 

May 5, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.33 Emails re Inventory; review letters re 297.00 
Stay; all emails re DIP; 

May 7, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.83 Edit email update to RSJ Morawetz; 439.90 
May 7, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.25 Review 	and 	revise 	update 	for 225.00 

Morawetz RSJ; 
May 9, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.47 Call with M. Crane regarding NDA; 

email to A&M; 
249.10 

May 11, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.25 Review emails; 225.00 
May 12, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.33 Call with A. Hutchens regarding 

various outstanding issues; 
174.90 

May 12, 2017 A.J. Taylor 1.17 Emails re Landlord requests; claim 
process; 	lien 	claims; 	telephone 
conversation 	with 	M. 	Shakra; 
telephone 	conversation 	with 	A. 

1,053.00 

Hutchens; 	conversation 	with 	L. 
Nicholson; 
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STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

FEE SUMMARY 

Timekeeper Hours Rate/ Hr Amount 
L. Nicholson 85.28 $530.00 $45,198.40 
M. Obee Tower 7.74 725.00 5,611.50 
A.J. Taylor 68.19 900.00 61,371.00 
Revisors 0.33 $530.00 $174.90 
Translators 1.83 385.00 704.55 

FEES 
Professional Services CAD $113,060.35 
HST @ 13.0% 14,697.85 
Total Professional Services and Taxes CAD $127,758.20 

CHARGES SUMMARY 

Description Taxable Non - Taxable Total 
Photocopies 1,443.50 1,443.50 
Total Charges 1,443.50 0.00 1,443.50 
HST @ 13.0% 187.66 
Total Charges and Taxes CAD $1631.16 

DISBURSEMENTS SUMMARY 

Description Taxable Non - Taxable Total 
Cash Received 0.00 0.00 
Book Binding/Binders 12.86 12.86 
Telephone 7.08 7.08 
Travel - Taxis 13.53 13.53 
Total Disbursements 33.47 0.00 33.47 
HST @ 13.0% 4.35 
Total Disbursements and Taxes CAD $37.82 
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STIKEMAN 

Ashley J. Ta 

STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

INVOICE SUMMARY 

Invoice No. 5537222 
Re: Payless ShoeSource 

Taxable Non-Taxable 

File No. 1194991005 

Total 

Professional Services 113,060.35 0.00 $113,060.35 

HST @ 13.0% 14,697.85 

Charges 1,443.50 0.00 1,443.50 

HST @ 13.0% 187.66 

Disbursements 33.47 0.00 33.47 

HST @ 13.0% 4.35 

AMOUNT DUE CAP $129,427,18 

Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-
judgement interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more. 

Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account. 
Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number when making payment. 
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STIKEMAN ELLIOTT 

Payment can be wired as follows: 

Please include dent number on transfer documents. 
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Stikeman Elliott Stikeman Elliott LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street 
Toronto, ON Canada M5L 1B9 

Main: 416 869 5500 
Fax: 416 947 0866 
www.stikeman.com  

GST / HST No. 1214111360001 
QST No. 1018978624 

Invoice 

September 11, 2017 

File No. 1194991005 
Client's Reference No. 119499 
Invoice No. 5567661 

Alvarez & Marsal 
220 Bay Street, Suite 2900 
Royal Bank Plaza, South Tower 
Toronto, ON M5J 2J1 

Attention: Alan Hutchens 

For Professional Services Rendered in connection with Payless ShoeSource for the period up to 
August 31, 2017. 

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount 

May 15, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.50 Discussion 	with 	T. 	Reyes 	regarding 265.00 
NDAs; call with M. Crane; 

May 15, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.75 Emails 	re 	Lien 	Claimant; 	telephone 
conversation 	with 	T. 	Reyes 	and 	L. 

675.00 

Nicholson; 
May 17, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.92 Call with P. Reisterer; email to A&M; draft 

email update for Morawetz RSJ. 
487.60 

May 17, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.75 Emails 	re 	Inventory; 	telephone 
conversation with M. MacKenzie; 

675.00 

May 19, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.25 Call with L. Wilde regarding information 
on Chapter 11 Proceedings. 

132.50 

May 23, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.17 Telephone conversation with D. Ullman; 
emails re Landlord Inquiries; 

153.00 

May 24, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.42 Call with D. Ullmann; 222.60 
May 24, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.17 Emails; 153.00 
May 25, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.25 Email update to A. Taylor regarding call 

with D. Ullmann; call with M. Mackenzie; 
132.50 

May 25, 2017 A.J. Taylor 0.17 Discussion with L. Nicholson; 153.00 
May 26, 2017 L. Nicholson 0.42 Call with A. Hutchens; call M. Mackenzie; 

email to P. Riesterer; 
222.60 
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Stikeman Elliott 

Hours 	Description 	 Amount 

0.42 	Conversation 	with 	L. 	Nicholson; 	378.00 
telephone conversation with A. Hutchens; 
all emails re Hearing; 

0.25 	Call with M. Crane; email to M. Crane 	132.50 
regarding claims procedure order in 
chapter 11 proceedings; call and leave 
voicemail for M. Mackenzie; 

0.33 	Emails re recognition; 	 297.00 
2.42 	Review chapter 11 materials for second 	1,282.60 

report; draft second report; 
4.67 	Review chapter 11 materials for second 	2,475.10 

report; draft second report; discussion 
with A. Taylor; 

0.42 	Emails re DIP recognition; emails re 	378.00 
report; conversation with L. Nicholson; 

4.58 	Draft second report; email to A. Taylor; 	2,427.40 
email to P. Riesterer; call with M. Crane. 

0.50 	Review and revise draft report; 	 450.00 
2.42 	Update first report; review and edit first 	1,282.60 

report; email to A. Hutchens; email to 
Osier; 

0.67 	Draft email to D. Ullmann; email to Prime 	355.10 
Clerk; emails with A&M; call with Osier; 

0.17 	Emails re Second Report 	 153.00 
1.50 	Review Osier comments on first report; 	795.00 

edit first report; review email from A. 
Hutchens regarding cash flow forecast; 

3.33 	Incorporate comments into first report; 	1,764.90 
edit first report; call with A. Hutchens and 
M. Mackenzie; serve first report; 

0.92 	Emails with Landlord's counsel; 	 828.00 

0.25 	Telephone 	conversation 	with 	M. 	225.00 
MacKenzie 	re 	Report; 	telephone 
conversation with D. Bish; 

3.17 	Review and edit company affidavit; email 	1,680.10 
to A&M regarding affidavit comments; 
email to A&M regarding second amended 
plan; review second amended plan; listen 
to audio recording of US hearing on 
disclosure statement; 

0.75 	Review draft affidavit; emails; 	 675.00 
4.75 	Review and edit draft second report; 	2,517.50 

email to M. MacKenzie regarding second 
report; review draft recognition order; 
email to P. Riesterer; 

1.58 	Emails with M. MacKenzie regarding 	837.40 
second report; edit second report and 
email second report to A. Taylor; email to 
Osier regarding draft affidavit; 

Date 
	

Timekeeper 

May 26, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

May 29, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

May 29, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 
May 30, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

May 31, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

May 31, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

Jun 1,2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Jun 1,2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 
Jun 2, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Jun 5, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Jun 5, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 
Jun 6, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Jun 7, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Jun 7, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 
Jun 12, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 

Jun 14, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Jun 14, 2017 
	

A.J. Taylor 
Jun 15, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 

Jun 16, 2017 
	

L. Nicholson 
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Stikeman Elliott 

Date 	 Timekeeper 	Hours 	Description 	 Amount 

Jun 17, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.50 	Edit second report; email to M. 	265.00 
MacKenzie; 

Jun 17, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.50 	Review and comment on draft report; 	450.00 
emails 

Jun 19, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	1.00 	Edit and finalize second report; various 	530.00 
emails regarding finalizing the second 
report; 

Jun 21, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	1.50 	Prepare for and attend motion for 	795.00 
recognition of final orders; email to A&M 
regarding court appearance; 

Jun 27, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.50 	All emails; conversation with L. Nicholson 	450.00 
re Hearing; 

Jun 29, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	3.50 	Review various Chapter 11 materials; 	1,855.00 
draft third report. 

Jun 30, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.33 	Review third report; email to A. Taylor. 	174.90 
Jun 30, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.33 	Review and comment on draft report; 	 297.00 
Jul 5, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.33 	Call with M. MacKenzie; edit third report 	174.90 

and email report to Osler. 
Jul 6, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.10 	Emails to Osler and A&M regarding 	53.00 

timing of third report. 
Jul 6, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.17 	All emails re Third Report; conversation 	153.00 

with L. Nicholson; 
Jul 18, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.33 	Emails regarding report; conversation 	297.00 

with L. Nicholson. 
Jul 19, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.50 	Call with P. Reisterer; email to A&M. 	 265.00 
Jul 20, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	1.25 	Review confirmation order; call with A&M. 	662.50 
Jul 20, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.25 	All emails regarding confirmation hearing; 	225.00 

review letter regarding construction lien. 
Jul 21, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	7.08 	Draft third report; call with P. Reisterer 	3,752.40 

regarding cure cost issue; discussion with 
A. Taylor regarding cure cost issue; 
review Plan and confirmation order in 
respect of cure cost issue; email to D. 
Ullmann regarding cure cost issue; 
review and comment on draft Plan 
recognition order. 

Jul 21, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	1.08 	Telephone 	conversation 	with 	M. 	972.00 
Wasserman; 	conversation with 	L. 
Nicholson; review emails and Plan; 

Jul 22, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.75 	Review notice of motion and draft order; 	397.50 
email to A&M. 

Jul 22, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.33 	All emails re US Plan; 	 297.00 

Jul 23, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	6.50 	Draft third report; email to Osler regarding 	3,445.00 
notice of motion changes; review email 
from D. Ullmann. 

Jul 24, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	8.75 	Continue drafting third report; call with M. 	4,637.50 
Crane; discussion with A. Taylor 
regarding payment of April rent; editing 
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Stikeman Elliott 

Date 	 Timekeeper 	Hours 	Description 	 Amount 

Third Report; call with M. MacKenzie 
regarding third report; review draft 
Schwindle 	affidavit; 	review 	emails 
regarding proposed recognition order; 
incorporate comments into third report; 
review revised Schwindle affidavit. 

Jul 24, 2017 	M. Obee Tower 	0.30 	Review and summarize interest rate 	217.50 
terms in exit financing. 

Jul 24, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	2.08 	Review draft orders; review draft Notice 	1,872.00 
of Motion; all emails re Plan confirmation; 
conversation with L. Nicholson; review 
draft report; 

Jul 25, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	2.58 	Review term loan credit agreement; call 	1,367.40 
with M. MacKenzie; review A&M 
comments on Third Report; edit Third 
Report; review final Schwindle affidavit 
review Osier comments on the Third 
Report. 

Jul 25, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.58 	All emails re Plan confirmation; review 	522.00 
comments on draft report; 

Jul 26, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	1.50 	Review and edit Third Report; review 	795.00 
email regarding liquidation analysis; 
review supplementary affidavit; review 
factum of Payless. 

Jul 27, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	1.42 	Call with P. Reisterer; email Report of 	752.60 
Justice Morawetz; arrange for filing of 
report; prepare for Plan recognition. 

Jul 27, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.50 	All emails re Motion; conversation with L. 	450.00 
Nicholson; 

Jul 28, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	1.43 	Prepare for and attend hearing on 	757.90 
recognition of Plan confirmation order; 
review letter from M. Crane. 

Aug 1, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.25 	Call with M. MacKenzie regarding letter 	132.50 
from D. Ullmann; call with M. Brouwer 
regarding payment of Canadian creditors. 

Aug 10, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.25 	Prepare Information Officer certificate; 	132.50 
arrange for signature of Information 
Officer certificate; 

Aug 11, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.17 	Arrange for filing of Information Officer 	90.10 
certificate; 

Aug 17, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.08 	Email to A&M regarding Blaney email. 	 42.40 

Aug 18, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.42 	Call with 	M. 	Brouwer regarding 	222.60 
outstanding rent payments; email to A. 
Hutchens regarding escrow amount; 
email D. Ullmann regarding property list. 

Aug 18, 2017 	A.J. Taylor 	0.42 	Review 	confirmation 	hearing 	378.00 
endorsement; all emails re Plan 
Implementation; 

Aug 30, 2017 	L. Nicholson 	0.33 	Call with P. Reisterer regarding escrow 	174.90 
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Stikeman Elliott 

Date 

Aug 31, 2017 

Aug 31, 2017 

Fee Summary 

Timekeeper 

L. Nicholson 

A.J. Taylor 

Hours 	Description 	 Amount 

funds; call with M. Brouwer; email to P. 
Reisterer regarding escrow funds. 

0.33 	Revise escrow funds order; emails on 	174.90 
escrow funds order; email to A. Hutchens 
regarding information officer report. 

0.17 	Emails re Escrow Funds; 	 153.00 

Timekeeper 

L. Nicholson 
M. Obee Tower 
A.J. Taylor 

Professional Services 
HST @ 13.0% 

Total Professional Services and Taxes 

Charges Summary 

Description  

Photocopies 

Total Charges 
HST @ 13.0% 

Total Charges and Taxes 

Hours Rate/Hr 

$530.00 
725.00 
900.00 

Amount 

$38,663.50 
217.50 

11,709.00 

CAD $50,590.00 
6,576.70 

CAD $57,166.70 

72.95 
0.30 

13.01 

 

	

Taxable 	Non - Taxable 	 Total  

	

1.50 	 1.50 

	

1.50 	 0.00 	 1.50 
0.19 

CAD $1.69 

Disbursements Summary 

Description  

Agents' Fees 

Business Meals - In Town 

Miscellaneous 

On-Line Search 

Telephone 

Total Disbursements 
HST @ 13.0% 

	

Taxable 	Non - Taxable 

285.00 

32.12 

70.29 

116.96 

1.77 

	

506.14 	 0.00 

Total 

285.00 

32.12 

70.29 

116.96 

1.77 

506.14 
65.80 

Total Disbursements and Taxes 	 CAD $571.94 
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Stikema 

Ashley 

Stikeman Elliott 

Invoice Summary 

Invoice No. 5567661 
File No. 1194991005 
Re: Payless ShoeSource 

Professional Services 

HST @ 13.0% 

Charges 

HST @ 13.0% 

Disbursements 

HST @ 13.0% 

Amount Due 

Taxable Non-Taxable Total 

50,590.00 0.00 $50,590.00 

6,576.70 

1.50 0.00 1.50 

0.19 

506.14 0.00 506.14 

65.80 

CAD $57,740.33 

Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-judgement 
interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more. 

Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account. 
Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 119499.1005/5567661 when making 
payment. 
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Stikeman Elliott 

Payment can be wired as follows: 

Please include client number on transfer documents. 
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EXHIBIT "B" 



THIS IS EXHIBIT "B", referred to in the 
Affidavit of Ashley Taylor, sworn on 
September 26, 2017. 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 



EXHIBIT "B" 
Summary of Stikeman Elliott LLP's Invoices 

Services Rendered from March 31, 2017 to August 31, 2017 

Invoice No. Date Fee Expenses HST Total 

5537222 May 12, 2017 113,060.35 1476.97 14,889.86 129,427.18 

5567661 September 11, 2017 50,590.00 507.64 6,642.69 57,740.33 

TOTAL 163,650.35 1,984.61 21,532.55 187,167.61 
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EXHIBIT "C" 



THIS IS EXHIBIT "C", referred to in the 
Affidavit of Ashley Taylor, sworn on 
September 26, 2017. 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 



EXHIBIT "C" 
Summary of Stikeman Elliott LLP's Invoices 

Services Rendered from March 31, 2017 to August 31, 2017 

NAME POSITION HOURLY RATE HOURS TOTAL 

A. Taylor Partner 900.00 81.20 73,080.00 

M. Obee Tower Partner 725.00 8.04 5,829.00 

L. Nicholson Associate 530.00 158.23 83,861.90 

Reviewer Other 530.00 .33 174.90 

Translators Other 385.00 1.83 704.55 

TOTAL 249.63 163,650.35 
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APPLICATION OF PAYLESS HOLDINGS LLC UNDER SECTION 46 OF THE COMPANIES' CREDITORS 

ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED 
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